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GEORGE WASHINGTON’S FAREWELL ADDRESS 

 

 
 

September 17, 1796 

Friends and Citizens:  

THE period for a new election of a citizen to administer the executive government of the United 
States being not far distant, and the time actually arrived when your thoughts must be employed 
in designating the person who is to be clothed with that important trust, it appears to me proper, 
especially as it may conduce to a more distinct expression of the public voice, that I should now 
apprise you of the resolution I have formed, to decline being considered among the number of 
those out of whom a choice is to be made.  

___________________ 

Here, perhaps, I ought to stop. But a solicitude for your welfare, which cannot end but with my 
life, and the apprehension of danger, natural to that solicitude, urge me, on an occasion like the 
present, to offer to your solemn contemplation, and to recommend to your frequent review, some 
sentiments which are the result of much reflection, of no inconsiderable observation, and which 
appear to me all-important to the permanency of your felicity as a people. These will be offered 
to you with the more freedom, as you can only see in them the disinterested warnings of a 
parting friend, who can possibly have no personal motive to bias his counsel.  
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Interwoven as is the love of liberty with every ligament of your hearts, no recommendation of 
mine is necessary to fortify or confirm the attachment.  

The unity of government which constitutes you one people is also now dear to you. It is justly so, 
for it is a main pillar in the edifice of your real independence, the support of your tranquility at 
home, your peace abroad; of your safety; of your prosperity; of that very liberty which you so 
highly prize. But as it is easy to foresee that, from different causes and from different quarters, 
much pains will be taken, many artifices employed to weaken in your minds the conviction of 
this truth; as this is the point in your political fortress against which the batteries of internal and 
external enemies will be most constantly and actively (though often covertly and insidiously) 
directed, it is of infinite moment that you should properly estimate the immense value of your 
national union to your collective and individual happiness; that you should cherish a cordial, 
habitual, and immovable attachment to it; accustoming yourselves to think and speak of it as of 
the palladium of your political safety and prosperity; watching for its preservation with jealous 
anxiety; discountenancing whatever may suggest even a suspicion that it can in any event be 
abandoned; and indignantly frowning upon the first dawning of every attempt to alienate any 
portion of our country from the rest, or to enfeeble the sacred ties which now link together the 
various parts.  

For this you have every inducement of sympathy and interest. Citizens, by birth or choice, of a 
common country, that country has a right to concentrate your affections. The name of American, 
which belongs to you in your national capacity, must always exalt the just pride of patriotism 
more than any appellation derived from local discriminations. With slight shades of difference, 
you have the same religion, manners, habits, and political principles. You have in a common 
cause fought and triumphed together; the independence and liberty you possess are the work of 
joint counsels, and joint efforts of common dangers, sufferings, and successes.  

But these considerations, however powerfully they address themselves to your sensibility, are 
greatly outweighed by those which apply more immediately to your interest. Here every portion 
of our country finds the most commanding motives for carefully guarding and preserving the 
union of the whole.  

__________________________________ 

In contemplating the causes which may disturb our Union, it occurs as matter of serious concern 
that any ground should have been furnished for characterizing parties by geographical 
discriminations, Northern and Southern, Atlantic and Western; whence designing men may 
endeavor to excite a belief that there is a real difference of local interests and views. One of the 
expedients of party to acquire influence within particular districts is to misrepresent the opinions 
and aims of other districts. You cannot shield yourselves too much against the jealousies and 
heartburnings which spring from these misrepresentations; they tend to render alien to each other 
those who ought to be bound together by fraternal affection.  

___________________________________ 
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They serve to organize faction, to give it an artificial and extraordinary force; to put, in the place 
of the delegated will of the nation the will of a party, often a small but artful and enterprising 
minority of the community; and, according to the alternate triumphs of different parties, to make 
the public administration the mirror of the ill-concerted and incongruous projects of faction, 
rather than the organ of consistent and wholesome plans digested by common counsels and 
modified by mutual interests.  

____________________________________ 

Let me now take a more comprehensive view, and warn you in the most solemn manner against 
the baneful effects of the spirit of party generally.  

This spirit, unfortunately, is inseparable from our nature, having its root in the strongest passions 
of the human mind. It exists under different shapes in all governments, more or less stifled, 
controlled, or repressed; but, in those of the popular form, it is seen in its greatest rankness, and 
is truly their worst enemy.  

The alternate domination of one faction over another, sharpened by the spirit of revenge, natural 
to party dissension, which in different ages and countries has perpetrated the most horrid 
enormities, is itself a frightful despotism.  

___________________________________ 

The common and continual mischiefs of the spirit of party are sufficient to make it the interest 
and duty of a wise people to discourage and restrain it.  

It serves always to distract the public councils and enfeeble the public administration. It agitates 
the community with ill-founded jealousies and false alarms, kindles the animosity of one part 
against another, foments occasionally riot and insurrection.  

___________________________________ 

There is an opinion that parties in free countries are useful checks upon the administration of the 
government and serve to keep alive the spirit of liberty. This within certain limits is probably 
true; and in governments of a monarchical cast, patriotism may look with indulgence, if not with 
favor, upon the spirit of party. But in those of the popular character, in governments purely 
elective, it is a spirit not to be encouraged. From their natural tendency, it is certain there will 
always be enough of that spirit for every salutary purpose. And there being constant danger of 
excess, the effort ought to be by force of public opinion, to mitigate and assuage it. A fire not to 
be quenched, it demands a uniform vigilance to prevent its bursting into a flame, lest, instead of 
warming, it should consume.  

Geo. Washington.  


